Amy L. Witts
Purchasing Agent

To:
From:
Date:

Re:

City of Cambridge

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
795 Massachusetts Ave. « Cambridge, Massachusetts 02139-3219

All Bidders
. City of Cambridge

July 21, 2014
File No. 6509- Receiving and Reuse/Disposal of Miscellaneous Debris

The following questions were submitted and answered.

3.

Question:
Could we please request a copy of the bid results from the previous year 7

Answer:
Attached is the copy of prior year Bid results.

Question:
Are you looking for open top containers to remove this material 7

Answer:
We are not locking for open top containers unless it is on the bidder's property that is properly permitted
to receive this material. The bidder must have proper State and Federal licenses and permits to own and

operate a transfer station.

Question:
Will this be a service call

Answer:
The delivery operation routinely occurs daily.

?

Question:
Wilt the container be in one place then called in for service ?

Answer:
The debris is delivered by City vehicles to the bidder’s location within a § mile radius of Cambridge City
Hall, 7956 Massachusetts Ave, Cambridge, MA 02139.

5. Question:

What is the material ?

Answer:
Please refer to Bid Specifications Section 3 Materials for definition.

All other details remain the same.

&%%.ww

Amy L. Witts
Purchasing Agent
ADDENDUM 1

Voice: 617.349.4310 Fax: 617.349.4008 TTY: 617.349.4242 Web: www.cambridgema.gov



wdo..|Flle No.5809

Date: June 7, 2012

Receiving and Reuse Disposal/of Debris & Pick up
‘Tab sheet .

Wmnog:m and Reuse Disposal of g_m_um_u:m

_ |Pick Up and Reuse/Disposal of Mis. Debris

<mm= One

" |Year One C.J.Mabardy|C.J.Mabardy WL French _wx.om.,__m..m_._m Corp. |WL French Excavating Corp.

1-a Mis debris |$39.95  [$207,740.00 [NoBid No Bid
1-b! Playground Structures ) $150.00 $7,500.00 |No Bid __iNo Bid
o Total One $215,240.00

Year Two ’ :
1-a " ‘Mis debris $55.00 $286,000.00 | No Bid No Bid
1-b iPlayground Structures ) $170.00 $8,500.00 |No Bid No Bid
| Total Two ] $294,50000 | )

‘Year Three ]
1-a5200 |Mis debris ~|$85.00 $338,000.00 |No Bid No Bid
1-b Playground Structures |$180.00 $9,000.00 |No Bid No Bid

| ToalThree T $347,000.00 | _,

C.J.Mabardy: C.J.Mabardy [WL French Excavating Corp.

WL French Excavating Corp.

~ Total Year Three

‘Recelved No Bids Item # 3 Receiving and Reuse Compost of Food Scraps

‘Received No Bids Item # 4 Receiving and Reuse Compost of Food Scraps & Yard Waste

2-a|10,400| Misc Depris $39.95 1$415,480.00 |$28.00 $291,200.00
2|50 [Playground Structures $150.00 $750000  1$100.00 $5,000.00
N Total Year One i $422.980.00 $2986,200.00

IYearTwo ) . , B
2-a|10,400|Misc Depris 7$55.00 $572,000.00 $29.00 15301,600.00
2-b|50 | Playground Structures $170.00  [$850000  $100.00 $5,000.00
1 ITotal Year Two ) $580,500.00 $306,600.00

" "'Year Three
Misc Depris N $65.00 $676,00000  |330.00 '1$312,000.00
Playground Structures o $180.00 $9,00000 |$100.00 '$5,000.00
al Y ) " 1$885,000.00 I_.. -$317,000.00




