City of Cambridge

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
795 Massachusetis Ave. « Cambridge, Massachusetts 02139-3219

Amy L. Witts
Purchasing Agent
TO: " All Bidders
FROM: City of Cambridge
DATE: December 31, 2015
RE: File No. 7107 - Water Department Chemicals

The following question was submitted and answered.

Question

1. s it possible to see last year’s results?

Answer

1. Please see the attached bid results from last year's Water Department Chemical Bid.
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Amy LVY¥itts
Purchasing Agent

Addendum No. 1

Voice: 617.349.4310 Fax; 617.349.4008 TTY:617.349.4242 Web: www.cambridgema.gov



Water Department Chemicals

File No 66596
Date; 1/22/15

s

-

8% | Nobid |$391,200.00 No bid $330,000.001 Nobid  |$309,000.00]  No bid Nobid | Harcross Chemical
No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid N bid No bid Monson Co [ne
-
.\ No bid No bid $205.200.00 |$240,000.00] Nobid {$164,400.00|  No bid No big | Shannon Chemical
$96,890.30 |  No bid No bid No bid no bid Nobid | $95997.00 | Nobid
$140,320.00]  Nobid No bid Nobid | $152.000.00] Nobid Nobid | $136,100.00
vmyw
- 15% $83,475.00 | Nobid No bid Nobid | $90,000.00 | No bid Mo bid | $83,445.00
92%|  rejected No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
: no bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid Nobid | $12,698.00




